
Kottayam Branch of ICAI
Tax Audit Seminar – 05/09/2022

Income Tax Act 1961
 Tax Audit u/s 44AB

A Practical Approach

CA. Prasanth Srinivas
S. S. Ayyar & Co., Kottayam

Ph: 9447125731 Email: ssayyarandco@gmail.com

1Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 05.09.2022



Contents

• Statutory Provisions
• Tax Audit Forms
•Other matters

2Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Part 1 – Statutory Provisions

3Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44 AB
Audit of accounts of certain persons Cases covered {(a) to (e) }

Clause (a)
• Every person carrying on business shall, if his total sales, turnover or gross 

receipts, as the case may be, in business exceed or exceeds one crore rupees in 
any previous year:

 

• Provided that in the case of a person whose—
(a) aggregate of all amounts received including amount received for sales, turnover 

or gross receipts during the previous year, in cash, does not exceed five per cent 
of the said amount; and

(b) aggregate of all payments made including amount incurred for expenditure, in cash, 
during the previous year does not exceed five per cent of the said payment,

this clause shall have effect as if for the words "one crore rupees", the words ten 
crore rupees" had been substituted:

 

• Provided further that for the purposes of this clause, the payment or receipt, as the 
case may be, by a cheque drawn on a bank or by a bank draft, which is not account 
payee, shall be deemed to be the payment or receipt, as the case may be, in cash; 

4Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AB Contd… 
Clause (b)

• Every person carrying on profession shall, if his gross 
receipts in profession exceed fifty lakh rupees in 
any previous year; or

Clause (c)
• Every person carrying on the business shall, if the 

profits and gains from the business are deemed to be 
the profits and gains of such person 
under section 44AE  or section 44BB (Exploration of 
mineral oil etc.) or section 44BBB (Foreign Companies 
in turnkey projects), as the case may be, and he has 
claimed his income to be lower than the profits or 
gains so deemed to be the profits and gains of his 
business, as the case may be, in any previous year; or

5Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AB Contd…
Clause (d)

• Every person carrying on the profession shall, if the profits 
and gains from the profession are deemed to be the profits 
and gains of such person under section 44ADA and he has 
claimed such income to be lower than the profits and gains 
so deemed to be the profits and gains of his profession and 
his income exceeds the maximum amount which is not 
chargeable to income-tax in any previous year; or

Clause (e)
• Every person carrying on the business shall, if the provisions 

of sub-section (4) of section 44AD are applicable in his case 
and his income exceeds the maximum amount which is not 
chargeable to income-tax in any previous year,

6Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AB Contd…
What if a person falls in any of the clauses from (a) - (e)

• Shall get his accounts of such previous year 
audited by an accountant 

• before the specified date and furnish by that 
date the report of such audit 

• in the prescribed form duly signed and verified 
by such accountant  (Forms 3CA/3CB)

• and setting forth such particulars as may be 
prescribed (Form 3CD)

7Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44 AB contd…
Cases where audit not required

• Provided that this section shall not apply to the person, who 
declares profits and gains for the previous year in accordance with 
the provisions of sub-section (1) of section 44AD and his total sales, 
turnover or gross receipts, as the case may be, in business does not 
exceed two crore rupees in such previous year:

 

• Provided further that this section shall not apply to the person, who 
derives income of the nature referred to in section 44B (Shipping 
Business of Non Resident) or section 44BBA (Aircraft business of Non 
Resident), on and from the 1st day of April, 1985 or, as the case may 
be, the date on which the relevant section came into force, 
whichever is later :

• Provided also that in a case where such person is required by or 
under any other law to get his accounts audited, it shall be sufficient 
compliance with the provisions of this section if such person gets the 
accounts of such business or profession audited under such law 
before the specified date and furnishes by that date the report of 
the audit as required under such other law and a further report by 
an accountant in the form prescribed under this section.

8Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AB contd…
definitions

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section—

• (i) "accountant" shall have the same meaning as in 
the Explanation below sub-section (2) of section 288; 
(i.e. Chartered Acccountant)

 
• (ii) "specified date", in relation to the accounts of the 

assessee of the previous year relevant to an 
assessment year, means date one month prior to the 
due date for furnishing the return of income under 
sub-section (1) of section 139. (31st Oct in TP cases and 
30th Sep in other cases)

9Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AD – Presumptive tax in business
Main provision

(1) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained 
in sections 28 to 43C, 
– in the case of an eligible assessee 
– engaged in an eligible business, 
– a sum equal to eight per cent of the total turnover or 

gross receipts of the assessee in the previous year on 
account of such business or, 

– as the case may be, a sum higher than the aforesaid 
sum claimed to have been earned by the eligible 
assessee, shall be deemed to be the profits and gains 
of such business chargeable to tax under the head 
"Profits and gains of business or profession":

10Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AD – Concessional rate – bank 
transactions

[Provided that this sub-section shall have effect as if 
for the words "eight per cent", the words "six per 
cent" had been substituted, in respect of the 
amount of total turnover or gross receipts which 
is received by an account payee cheque or an 
account payee bank draft or use of electronic 
clearing system through a bank account or 
through such other electronic mode as may be 
prescribed during the previous year or before the 
due date specified in sub-section (1) 
of section 139 in respect of that previous year.

11Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AD – Deductions and depreciation 
deemed as allowed

• (2) Any deduction allowable under the provisions 
of sections 30 to 38 shall, for the purposes of 
sub-section (1), be deemed to have been already given full 
effect to and no further deduction under 
those sections shall be allowed.

 
• [***] Working partners remuneration and interest which 

were earlier allowable had been since omitted
 
• (3) The written down value of any asset of an eligible 

business shall be deemed to have been calculated as if the 
eligible assessee had claimed and had been actually allowed 
the deduction in respect of the depreciation for each of the 
relevant assessment years. Deemed depreciation

12Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Sec 44AD – opted in one year – opted out in any of the 
next 5 years

(4) Where an eligible assessee declares profit for any 
previous year in accordance with the provisions of 
this section and 

he declares profit for any of the five assessment years 
relevant to the previous year succeeding such previous 
year not in accordance with the provisions of 
sub-section (1), 

he shall not be eligible to claim the benefit of the 
provisions of this section for five assessment years 
subsequent to the assessment year relevant to the 
previous year in which the profit has not been declared 
in accordance with the provisions of sub-section (1).

13Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AD – Consequence of opting out as 
referred to in subsection (4)

(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing 
provisions of this section, 

an eligible assessee to whom the provisions of 
sub-section (4) are applicable and (i.e. opted out)

whose total income exceeds the maximum amount 
which is not chargeable to income-tax,  (TI > BE)

shall be required to keep and maintain such books of 
account and other documents as required under 
sub-section (2) of section 44AA and get them audited 
and furnish a report of such audit as required 
under section 44AB

14Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AD – Who cannot opt?
(6) The provisions of this section, 

notwithstanding anything contained in the 
foregoing provisions, shall not apply to—

(i) a person carrying on profession as referred to in 
sub-section (1) of section 44AA;

 

(ii) a person earning income in the nature of 
commission or brokerage; or

 

(iii) a person carrying on any agency business. 

15Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AD - Definition
• Explanation.—For the purposes of this section,—

(a) "eligible assessee" means,—
(i) an individual, Hindu undivided family or a 
partnership firm, who is a resident, but not a limited 
liability partnership firm as defined under clause (n) of 
sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Limited Liability 
Partnership Act, 2008 (6 of 2009); and

(ii) who has not claimed deduction under any of 
the sections 10A, 10AA, 10B, 10BA or deduction under 
any provisions of Chapter VIA under the heading "C. - 
Deductions in respect of certain incomes" in the 
relevant assessment year;

16Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AD - Definition

(b) "eligible business" means,—
 

(i) any business except the business of plying, hiring 
or leasing goods carriages referred to 
in section 44AE; and

(ii) whose total turnover or gross receipts in the 
previous year does not exceed an amount of two 
crore rupees

17Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44ADA – Presumptive Tax - Profession
• (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in sections 28 to 43C,
• in case of an assessee, being an individual or a partnership 

firm other than a limited liability partnership as defined under 
clause (n) of sub-section (1) of section 269 of the Limited 
Liability Partnership Act, 2008 (6 of 2009), 

• who is a resident in India, and 
• is engaged in a profession referred to in sub-section (1) 

of section 44AA and 
• whose total gross receipts do not exceed fifty lakh rupees in a 

previous year,
•  a sum equal to fifty per cent of the total gross receipts of 

the assessee in the previous year on account of such 
profession or, as the case may be, a sum higher than the 
aforesaid sum claimed to have been earned by the assessee, 
shall be deemed to be the profits and gains of such profession 
chargeable to tax under the head "Profits and gains of 
business or profession".

18Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44ADA – Deductions and depreciation 
deemed as allowed

• (2) Any deduction allowable under the provisions 
of sections 30 to 38 shall, for the purposes of 
sub-section (1), be deemed to have been already given 
full effect to and no further deduction under those 
sections shall be allowed.

• (3) The written down value of any asset used for the 
purposes of profession shall be deemed to have been 
calculated as if the assessee had claimed and had been 
actually allowed the deduction in respect of the 
depreciation for each of the relevant assessment 
years.

19Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44ADA – Consequence of declaring lower 
income

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in the 
foregoing provisions of this section, 
an assessee who claims that his profits and gains 
from the profession are lower than the profits and 
gains specified in sub-section (1) and
whose total income exceeds the maximum 
amount which is not chargeable to income-tax, 
shall be required to keep and maintain such books 
of account and other documents as required 
under sub-section (1) of section 44AA and get 
them audited and furnish a report of such audit as 
required under section 44AB.]

20Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AE – Transport business – Presumptive tax

(1) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary 
contained in sections 28 to 43C, 
in the case of an assessee, who owns not more than 
ten goods carriages [at any time during the previous 
year] and
who is engaged in the business of plying, hiring or 
leasing such goods carriages,
the income of such business chargeable to tax under 
the head "Profits and gains of business or profession" 
shall be deemed to be the aggregate of the profits and 
gains, from all the goods carriages owned by him in 
the previous year, computed in accordance with the 
provisions of sub-section (2).

21Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AE - Computation
(2) For the purposes of sub-section (1), the profits and gains from 

each goods carriage,—

(i) being a heavy goods vehicle, shall be an amount equal to 
one thousand rupees per ton of gross vehicle weight or 
unladen weight, as the case may be, for every month or part of 
a month during which the heavy goods vehicle is owned by the 
assessee in the previous year or an amount claimed to have 
been actually earned from such vehicle, whichever is higher;

(ii) other than heavy goods vehicle, shall be an amount equal 
to seven thousand five hundred rupees for every month or 
part of a month during which the goods carriage is owned by 
the assessee in the previous year or an amount claimed to 
have been actually earned from such goods carriage, 
whichever is higher.

22Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



44AE – Deductions deemed as allowed and WP 
remuneration and interest

(3) Any deduction allowable under the provisions of sections 
30 to 38 shall, for the purposes of sub-section (1), be 
deemed to have been already given full effect to and no 
further deduction under those sections shall be allowed :
[Provided that where the assessee is a firm, the salary and 
interest paid to its partners shall be deducted from the 
income computed under sub-section (1) subject to the 
conditions and limits specified in clause (b) of section 40.

(4) The written down value of any asset used for the purpose 
of the business referred to in sub-section (1) shall be 
deemed to have been calculated as if the assessee had 
claimed and had been actually allowed the deduction in 
respect of the depreciation for each of the relevant 
assessment years.

23Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AE – Tax audit
(5) The provisions of sections 44AA and 44AB shall not apply in 

so far as they relate to the business referred to in sub-section 
(1) and in computing the monetary limits under those 
sections, the gross receipts or, as the case may be, the 
income from the said business shall be excluded.

Sub section (6) is not relevant – hence not discussed

• (7) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing 
provisions of this section, an assessee may claim lower 
profits and gains than the profits and gains specified in 
sub-sections (1) and (2), if he keeps and maintains such 
books of account and other documents as required under 
sub-section (2) of section 44AA and gets his accounts audited 
and furnishes a report of such audit as required 
under section 44AB.]

24Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AE - Definitions
• Explanation.—For the purposes of this section,—

(a) the expressions "goods carriage”, "gross vehicle 
weight” and "unladen weight” shall have the respective 
meanings assigned to them in section 2 of the Motor 
Vehicles Act, 1988 (59 of 1988);

 
(aa) the expression "heavy goods vehicle" means any goods 
carriage, the gross vehicle weight of which exceeds 12000 
kilograms;

 
(b) an assessee, who is in possession of a goods carriage, 
whether taken on hire purchase or on instalments and for 
which the whole or part of the amount payable is still due, 
shall be deemed to be the owner of such goods carriage. 

25Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AA – Maintenance of Books

(1) Every person carrying on legal, medical, 
engineering or architectural profession or the 
profession of accountancy or technical 
consultancy or interior decoration or any other 
profession as is notified by the Board in the 
Official Gazette shall keep and maintain such 
books of account and other documents as may 
enable the Assessing Officer to compute his total 
income in accordance with the provisions of this 
Act. (Specified / Notified Profession)

26Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AA – Books to be kept by other persons

(2) Every person carrying on business or profession [not being a profession referred to in 
sub-section (1) shall,—

(i) if his income from business or profession exceeds one lakh twenty thousand rupees or his 
total sales, turnover or gross receipts, as the case may be, in business or profession exceed or 
exceeds ten lakh rupees in any one of the three years immediately preceding the previous year; 
or

(ii) where the business or profession is newly set up in any previous year, if his income from 
business or profession is likely to exceed one lakh twenty thousand rupees or his total sales, 
turnover or gross receipts, as the case may be, in business or profession are or is likely to 
exceed ten lakh rupees, during such previous year; or

 

(iii) where the profits and gains from the business are deemed to be the profits and gains of the 
assessee under  section 44AE or section 44BB or section 44BBB, as the case may be, and the 
assessee has claimed his income to be lower than the profits or gains so deemed to be the 
profits and gains of his business, as the case may be, during such previous year; or

(iv) where the provisions of sub-section (4) of section 44AD are applicable in his case and his 
income exceeds the maximum amount which is not chargeable to income-tax in any previous 
year

keep and maintain such books of account and other documents as may enable 
the Assessing Officer to compute his total income in accordance with the provisions 
of this Act:

27Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AA – Certain relaxations in Subsection (2)

• Provided that in the case of a person being an 
individual or a Hindu undivided family, the provisions 
of clause (i) and clause (ii) shall have effect, as if for 
the words "one lakh twenty thousand rupees", the 
words "two lakh fifty thousand rupees" had been 
substituted :

• Provided further that in the case of a person being an 
individual or a Hindu undivided family, the provisions 
of clause (i) and clause (ii) shall have effect, as if for 
the words "ten lakh rupees", the words "twenty-five 
lakh rupees" had been substituted.]

28Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Section 44AA – Powers of CBDT

• (3) The Board may, having regard to the nature of the 
business or profession carried on by any class of persons, 
prescribe, by rules (Rule 6F), the books of account and 
other documents (including inventories, wherever 
necessary) to be kept and maintained under sub-section (1) 
or sub-section (2), the particulars to be contained therein 
and the form and the manner in which and the place at 
which they shall be kept and maintained. (Books registers 
etc prescrible only for notified / specified professionals)

• (4) Without prejudice to the provisions of sub-section (3), 
the Board may prescribe, by rules, the period for which the 
books of account and other documents to be kept and 
maintained under sub-section (1) or sub-section (2) shall be 
retained. (generally till such time assessment could not be 
reopened)

29Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Part 2 – Tax Audit Forms Analysed

30Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Forms 3CB
Form 3CB is for those persons 
whose accounts have not been 
audited under any other law. 
So we can say, this is for the 
people who are audited under 
the income tax act

Auditor has to certify two 
things
• Whether accounts are true 
and fair and
• Whether 3CD particulars are 
true and correct 

31Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CA
Form 3CA is for those persons 
whose accounts have been 
audited under any law other than 
the Income Tax laws

Here the auditor has to
• Make reference to the audit 
under the other Act
• certify whether 3CD particulars 
are true and correct

32Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD – Part A – Cl. 1 to 8a

33Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD Cl. 9 to 12

34Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD – Cl. 13

35Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD – Cl. 14 – 16

36Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD – Cl. 17 & 18

37Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD – Cl. 19 & 20
32 AD – Investment in assets – 
Notified backward areas
33 AB – Tea Development Account
33 ABA – Site Restoration Fund
35 – Scientific Research
35 ABA – Telecom Spectrum
35 ABB – Telecom License
35 AD – Capital Expenditure allowed 
as deduction in specified businesses
35 CCA – Contribution to institutions 
carrying out approved rural 
development programme
35 CCC – Agricultural extension 
project
35 CCD – Skill development project
35 D – Amortisation of preliminary 
expense
35 DD – Amalgamation / De-merger 
expenses
35 DDA – VRS expense 
35 E – Expense for prospecting 
minerals

38Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD – Cl. 21

39Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD
Cl 21 contd…

40Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD 
Cl 21 Contd

(ib) – Equalisation levy

(ic) – FBT
(iia) – Wealth Tax
(iib) – Royalty paid by State PSU to 
State Govt in lieu of dividend

(iii) – Salary to NR with out TDS

(iv) – Unrecognised PF
(v) – Tax on non-monetary perquisites

41Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD Cl 21 contd…

42Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD Cl 22 to 27

43Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD
Cl 28 to 29 B

Gift received by firm or 
company – Section 56 (2) 
(viia)

Securities premium  – 
Section 56 (2) (viib)

Advance forfeited -  – 
Section 56 (2) (ix)

Gift received by other 
persons – Section 56 (2) (x)

44Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD
Cl 30 to 30C

45Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD Cl 31 (269SS)

46Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD – Cl 31 – 269ST

47Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD
Cl 31 – 269 T

48Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD
Cl 32 & 33

49Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD
Cl 34

50Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD
Cl. 35

51Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD
Clause 36A to 41

52Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD – Cl. 42 & 43

53Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Form 3CD – Cl 44

54Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Part 3 – Other Matters

55Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Other matters
• Time is the essence – Due dates not likely to be 

extended this year – Well begun is half done
• Getting finalised accounts is very important
• Data analytics is the key 
• Penalty – 271A (Non maintenance of Books – Rs. 

25,000), 271B (Not getting accounts audited – 0.50% 
of TO up to Rs. 1,50,000)

• Auditing standards – Documentation – Sampling etc.
• AS / ICDS & AS for non corporates issued by ICAI
• ICAI guidance note (Latest one is circulated)
• Clause 44
• Sec 194 Q vs. 206C(1H)

56Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



Other matters
• Tax audit regarding charitable trusts – top 

priority as delay is fatal
• Transfer pricing – Audit Report – Form 3CEB
• UDIN and UDIN uploading in tax site
• Maintain list of tax audits done
– Ceiling on no. of audits – 60 / member
– Peer review purposes
– Empanelment purposes

• Billing to commensurate the volume of work – 
Don’t underquote

57Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022



For your valuable views…

Thanks for this learning opportunity

58Kottayam ICAI - Prasanth Srinivas – 
05.09.2022


